

W. G. I.

AGENDA COVER MEMO

DATE: May 18, 2005
TO: Board of Commissioners
FROM: Public Works - Engineering
PRESENTED BY: Sonny P. A. Chickering, County Engineer

**AGENDA
ITEM TITLE:** IN THE MATTER OF AWARDING REQUIREMENT CONTRACTS TO
VARIOUS CONTRACTORS TO ESTABLISH UNIT PRICES FOR ROCK
MATERIAL NEEDS DURING FISCAL YEAR 2005/2006, PROSPECTIVE
CONTRACT NO. 05/06-M&S-51A

I. MOTION

THAT THE ATTACHED BOARD ORDER BE ADOPTED AWARDING REQUIREMENT CONTRACTS TO VARIOUS CONTRACTORS FOR FURNISHING ROCK MATERIALS FOR FISCAL YEAR 2005/2006, AND THAT THE CONTRACTS BE EXECUTED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE BID SPECIFICATIONS, AND THAT THE COUNTY ADMINISTRATOR BE AUTHORIZED TO SIGN THE CONTRACTS.

II. ISSUE OR PROBLEM

These contracts are for furnishing rock materials to be used in the maintenance of County roads, bridge approaches, and shoulder widenings during fiscal year 2005/2006.

III. DISCUSSION

A. Background

Rock materials are reapplied to County road shoulders in order to maintain and provide a safe traveling surface, and to minimize the breakdown of pavement under heavy traffic and inclement weather conditions.

Rock material requirement contracts are awarded annually to all qualifying bidders, thus guaranteeing Lane County the best price for the materials based on the low bid and hauling cost.

Contract specifications require Lane County to purchase at least \$100.00 of materials from each qualifying bidder. These materials are purchased as needed during the term of the contract; therefore, a contract dollar amount cannot be specified.

Agenda Cover Memo – May 18, 2005
Rock Materials, Requirement Contract No. 05/06-M&S-51A

B. Analysis

The use of rock materials in road maintenance helps prevent potential safety hazards and reduce capital improvement expenditures.

C. Alternatives/Options

Bid all rock under a single contract. This is difficult because the quantities needed by Lane County are unknown at this time. It also works to the disadvantage of small operators who cannot produce every type of rock needed by the County.

D. Recommendation

Award requirement contracts to qualified bidders.

IV. IMPLEMENTATION/FOLLOW-UP

Rock materials will be purchased as needed to maintain County roads and provide a safe traveling surface for the public.

ATTACHMENTS

Board Order
Bid Recap

IN THE BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS OF LANE COUNTY
STATE OF OREGON

ORDER NO. (IN THE MATTER OF AWARDING REQUIREMENT
(CONTRACTS TO VARIOUS CONTRACTORS TO
(ESTABLISH UNIT PRICES FOR ROCK MATERIAL
(NEEDS DURING FISCAL YEAR 2005/2006,
(PROSPECTIVE CONTRACT NO. 05/06-M&S-51A

WHEREAS, on May 18, 2005, Arno Nelson, Road Maintenance Manager, Lane County Department of Public Works, under authority of Lane Manual, Chapter 21, opened bids for Rock Materials, Prospective Contract No. 05/06-M&S-51A; and

WHEREAS, bids were submitted by Mapleton Rock Products, Inc., Conser Quarry Co., Lloyd S. Hockema, Inc., Rock Products, Inc., Morse Bros., J. Davidson & Sons Construction Co., Inc. (Yard 3, Kitson Springs & Camp Creek Quarry), Hawley Creek Quarry Co., and Martin Creek Quarry Co., and the Director of the Department of Public Works recommends that these bids be accepted; **NOW THEREFORE BE IT**

ORDERED that the bid received from Mapleton Rock Products, Inc., Conser Quarry Co., Lloyd S. Hockema, Inc., Rock Products, Inc., Morse Bros., J. Davidson & Sons Construction Co., Inc. (Yard 3, Kitson Springs & Camp Creek Quarry), Hawley Creek Quarry Co., and Martin Creek Quarry Co., be accepted as recommended; and it is further

ORDERED that Mapleton Rock Products, Inc., Conser Quarry Co., Lloyd S. Hockema, Inc., Rock Products, Inc., Morse Bros., J. Davidson & Sons Construction Co., Inc. (Yard 3, Kitson Springs & Camp Creek Quarry), Hawley Creek Quarry Co., and Martin Creek Quarry Co., be awarded contracts for the 2005/2006 fiscal year, in accordance with the bid specifications; and it is further

ORDERED that these contracts be executed in accordance with this Order and the bid specifications, and that the County Administrator be authorized to sign the contracts.

DATED this _____ day of _____, 2005

Anna Morrison, Chair
Lane County Board of Commissioners

APPROVED AS TO FORM

Date 8-20-05 lane county


OFFICE OF LEGAL COUNSEL

**LANE COUNTY DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS
BID RECAP**

Description: ROCK MATERIALS

Bid Opening: 10:00 A.M., WEDNESDAY, MAY 18, 2005

Contract No.: 05/06-M&S-51A

Prepared By: SCF

Checked By: Road Maintenance

ITEM NO.	ITEM	UNIT	#1 CONCER QUARRY CO 27387 FERGUSON RD JUNCTION CITY OR 97448	#2 HAWLEY CREEK QUARRY INC. PO BOX 1000 COTTAGE GROVE OR 97424	#3 J DAVIDSON & SONS CONST CO., INC. PO BOX 1018 OAKRIDGE OR 97463 (CAMP CREEK QUARRY)	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
1.	6"-0" Crushed Rock	Per Ton	5.20	NO BID		6.00	
2.	5"-3" Crushed (Logger Special)	Per Ton	NO BID	5.19		NO BID	
3.	5"-0" Crushed Rock	Per Ton	NO BID	5.19		6.00	
4.	3"-0" Crushed Rock	Per Ton	4.70	5.19		6.00	
5.	1 1/2"-0" Crushed Open	Per Ton	5.20	5.58		6.00	
6.	3/4"-0" Crushed Rock	Per Ton	5.50	5.58		6.00	
7.	1/4"-0" Crushed Rock	Per Ton	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	
8.	1/4"-No. 10 Sanding Rock	Per Ton	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	
9.	6"-3" Round Rock	Per Ton	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	
10.	3/8" Round (Pea Rock)	Per Ton	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	
11.	6" Round Open	Per Ton	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	
12.	3" Round Open	Per Ton	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	
13.	1 1/2" Round Open	Per Ton	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	
14.	Bar Run	Per Ton	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	
15.	Quarry Pit Run	Per Ton	4.50	3.85		5.25	
16.	Machine Selected Rip Rap	Per Ton	8.00	6.35		10.00	
17.	Loam	Per Ton	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	
18.	Fill Sand	Per Ton	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	

**LANE COUNTY DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS
BID RECAP**

Description: ROCK MATERIALS

Bid Opening: 10:00 A.M., WEDNESDAY, MAY 18, 2005

Contract No.: 05/06-M&S-51A

Prepared By: SCF

Checked By: Road Maintenance

ITEM NO.	ITEM	UNIT	UNIT PRICE	#1 CONCER QUARRY CO 27387 FERGUSON RD JUNCTION CITY OR 97448	#2 HAWLEY CREEK QUARRY INC. PO BOX 1000 COTTAGE GROVE OR 97424	#3 J DAVIDSON & SONS CONST CO., INC. PO BOX 1018 OAKRIDGE OR 97463 (CAMP CREEK QUARRY)
19.	6" Open	Per Ton	5.40			
20.	6"-0" Crushed - Jaw Run	Per Ton	5.20		4.42	
21.	1/2"-0" Crushed Rock	Per Ton	7.90			
22.	6"-3" Open Crushed	Per Ton	NO BID			
23.	1 1/2" Open Crushed	Per Ton	5.70			
24.	6" Crushed Open	Per Ton	5.40			
25.	3" Crushed Open	Per Ton	4.95			
26.	3/4" Reject	Per Ton	NO BID			
27.	6"-3" Crushed Rock	Per Ton	NO BID			
28.	3"-1 1/2" Crushed Rock	Per Ton	NO BID			
29.	3/4" Crushed Reject	Per Ton	NO BID			
	* DEVIATIONS		N/A		N/A	N/A

LANE COUNTY DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS
BID RECAP

Description: ROCK MATERIALS

Bid Opening: 10:00 A.M., WEDNESDAY, MAY 18, 2005

Contract No.: 05/06-M&S-51A

Prepared By: SCF

Checked By: Road Maintenance

ITEM NO.	ITEM	UNIT	#4 J DAVIDSON & SONS CONST CO., INC. PO BOX1018 OAKRIDGE OR 97463 (YARD 3, KITSON SPRINGS)	#5 LLOYD S. HOCKEMA INC PO BOX 1085 FLORENCE OR 97439	#6 MAPLETON ROCK PRODUCTS INC. PO BOX 63 MAPLETON OR 97453
		UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
1.	6"-0" Crushed Rock	Per Ton	NO BID	5.85	NO BID
2.	5"-3" Crushed (Logger Special)	Per Ton	NO BID	6.35	NO BID
3.	5"-0" Crushed Rock	Per Ton	NO BID	8.85	NO BID
4.	3"-0" Crushed Rock	Per Ton	5.75	6.35	6.75
5.	1 1/2"-0" Crushed Open	Per Ton	6.00	6.50	7.05
6.	3/4"-0" Crushed Rock	Per Ton	6.25	6.75	7.25
7.	1/4"-0" Crushed Rock	Per Ton	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
8.	1/4"-No. 10 Sanding Rock	Per Ton	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
9.	6"-3" Round Rock	Per Ton	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
10.	3/8" Round (Pea Rock)	Per Ton	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
11.	6" Round Open	Per Ton	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
12.	3" Round Open	Per Ton	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
13.	1 1/2" Round Open	Per Ton	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
14.	Bar Run	Per Ton	5.00	NO BID	NO BID
15.	Quarry Pit Run	Per Ton	6.50	5.45	6.70
16.	Machine Selected Rip Rap	Per Ton	NO BID	8.75+	9.00
17.	Loam	Per Ton	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
18.	Fill Sand	Per Ton	NO BID	10.00	NO BID

**LANE COUNTY DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS
BID RECAP**

Description: ROCK MATERIALS

Bid Opening: 10:00 A.M., WEDNESDAY, MAY 18, 2005

Contract No.: 05/06-M&S-51A

Prepared By: SCF

Checked By: Road Maintenance

ITEM NO.	ITEM	UNIT	#4 J DAVIDSON & SONS CONST CO., INC. PO BOX 1018 OAKRIDGE OR 97463 (YARD 3, KITSON SPRINGS)	#5 LLOYD S. HOCKEMA INC PO BOX 1085 FLORENCE OR 97439	#6 MAPLETON ROCK PRODUCTS INC. PO BOX 63 MAPLETON OR 97453
		UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
19.	6" Open	Per Ton	NO BID	5.85	NO BID
20.	6"-0" Crushed - Jaw Run	Per Ton	NO BID	NO BID	6.35
21.	1/2"-0" Crushed Rock	Per Ton	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
22.	6"-3" Open Crushed	Per Ton	NO BID	8.00	NO BID
23.	1 1/2" Open Crushed	Per Ton	NO BID	8.00	NO BID
24.	6" Crushed Open	Per Ton	NO BID	10.00	NO BID
25.	3" Crushed Open	Per Ton	NO BID	10.00	NO BID
26.	3/4" Reject	Per Ton	NO BID	5.00	NO BID
27.	6"-3" Crushed Rock	Per Ton	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
28.	3"-1 1/2" Crushed Rock	Per Ton	NO BID	10.00	NO BID
29.	3/4" Crushed Reject	Per Ton	NO BID	5.00	NO BID
	* DEVIATIONS		N/A	N/A	N/A

**LANE COUNTY DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS
 BID RECAP**

Description: ROCK MATERIALS

Bid Opening: 10:00 A.M., WEDNESDAY, MAY 18, 2005

Contract No.: 05/06-M&S-51A

Prepared By: SCF

Checked By: Road Maintenance

ITEM NO.	ITEM	UNIT	#7 MARTIN CREEK QUARRY INC. PO BOX 1000 COTTAGE GROVE OR 97424	UNIT PRICE	#8 MORSE BROS 1001 DIVISION AVE EUGENE OR 97404	UNIT PRICE	#9 ROCK PRODUCTS INC. 400 COUNTRYCLUB RD SUITE 320 EUGENE OR 97401	UNIT PRICE
1.	6"-0" Crushed Rock	Per Ton	NO BID		6.25		NO BID	
2.	5"-3" Crushed (Logger Special)	Per Ton	6.06		6.00		NO BID	
3.	5"-0" Crushed Rock	Per Ton	6.06		6.25		NO BID	
4.	3"-0" Crushed Rock	Per Ton	6.06		6.25		NO BID	
5.	1 1/2"-0" Crushed Open	Per Ton	5.56		6.00		NO BID	
6.	3/4"-0" Crushed Rock	Per Ton	5.56		6.00		NO BID	
7.	1/4"-0" Crushed Rock	Per Ton	NO BID		7.50		NO BID	
8.	1/4"-No. 10 Sanding Rock	Per Ton	NO BID		9.50*		NO BID	
9.	6"-3" Round Rock	Per Ton	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
10.	3/8" Round (Pea Rock)	Per Ton	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
11.	6" Round Open	Per Ton	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
12.	3" Round Open	Per Ton	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
13.	1 1/2" Round Open	Per Ton	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	5.00
14.	Bar Run	Per Ton	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	2.50
15.	Quarry Pit Run	Per Ton	4.50		5.50		NO BID	
16.	Machine Selected Rip Rap	Per Ton	8.05		8.00		NO BID	
17.	Loam	Per Ton	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	10.00
18.	Fill Sand	Per Ton	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	

**LANE COUNTY DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS
BID RECAP**

Description: ROCK MATERIALS

Bid Opening: 10:00 A.M., WEDNESDAY, MAY 18, 2005

Contract No.: 05/06-M&S-51A

Prepared By: SCF

Checked By: Road Maintenance

ITEM NO.	ITEM	UNIT	#7 MARTIN CREEK QUARRY INC. PO BOX 1000 COTTAGE GROVE OR 97424	#8 MORSE BROS 32260 OLD HWY 34 TANGENT OR 97389	#9 ROCK PRODUCTS INC. 400 COUNTRY CLUB RD SUITE 320 EUGENE OR 97401	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
19.	6" Open	Per Ton	NO BID	7.00	NO BID	7.00	NO BID
20.	6"-0" Crushed - Jaw Run	Per Ton	5.00	4.75	NO BID	4.75	NO BID
21.	1/2"-0" Crushed Rock	Per Ton	6.06	7.25	NO BID	7.25	NO BID
22.	6"-3" Open Crushed	Per Ton	5.50	7.00	NO BID	7.00	NO BID
23.	1 1/2" Open Crushed	Per Ton	6.06	6.00	NO BID	6.00	NO BID
24.	6" Crushed Open	Per Ton	5.50	7.00	NO BID	7.00	NO BID
25.	3" Crushed Open	Per Ton	5.50	7.00	NO BID	7.00	NO BID
26.	3/4" Reject	Per Ton	6.06*	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
27.	6"-3" Crushed Rock	Per Ton	5.06	7.00	NO BID	7.00	NO BID
28.	3"-1 1/2" Crushed Rock	Per Ton	NO BID	7.00	NO BID	7.00	NO BID
29.	3/4" Crushed Reject	Per Ton	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	* DEVIATIONS		Item #26: Changed to 3/4" Open	Item #8: Available at Eugene plant only			N/A